ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER
(205) 325-5381
TABULATION SHEET FOR

BID#110-18 "FRESH BREAD & ROLLS"

1 2
FLOWERS BAKING CO OF BIRMINGHAM, LLC BIMBO BAKERIES USA
MINIMUM PRICE PRODUCT ITEM MINIMUM PRICE
GROUP | - LOAF OF BREAD GROUP | - LOAF OF BREAD (DESCRIPTION) PRODUCT ITEM NUMBER| PACKAGING ST e NUMBER PACKAGING = (EACH)
1 18 OZ. WHOLE GRAIN AND SEEDS — OVAL SLICES 10390270 LOAF 12 $2.40 3116 ARNOLD 12 GRAIN 24 0Z | LEET BLANK $2.25
20 0Z. LOAF BREAD, LOAF-KING, WHITE, SOFT, SANDWICH COLONIAL WHITE
2 SLICED, 24 USABLE SLICES xxx10160 LOAF 7 3185 3935 SANDWICH 2007, 24 sLice | SEFTBLANK $L65
3 LOAF BREAD, WHITE, LITE, 40-CALS/SLICE 12615040 LOAF 10 $2.40 NOBID NO BID LEET BLANK $0.00
4 20 0Z. LOAF BREAD, WHITE, OLD FASHIONED, ROUND TOP wxx10220 LOAF 8 $1.85 3934 (Z:OOCL)SN'AL OLDFASHION 1| prr g1 ank $1.65
. THOMAS CINN RAISIN
5 16 OZ. LOAF BREAD, RAISIN LOAF 12 $2.55 7097 SWIRL 16 OZ. LEFT BLANK $2.50
COLONIAL WHITE
6 20 0Z LOAF BREAD, WHITE xxx10160 LOAF 8 $1.85 3935 SANDWICH 20 07 24 SLICE| LEETBLANK $1.65
7 20 0Z LOAF BREAD, WHITE BUTTER CRUST OLD FASHION 10215200 LOAF 8 $1.85 2766 gOAgA LEEBUTTEBREAD || prrp) ank $1.80
SARA LEE WHEAT
8 20 OZ LOAF BREAD, WHEAT SANDWICH SLICED 10215260 LOAF 8 $2.34 2773 ROUNDTOP 20 07, LEFT BLANK $1.80
9 16 0Z LOAF BREAD, LITE WHEAT, 40 CAL/SLICE 12615020 LOAF 10 $2.40 2779 SARA LEE MG 45 CA; 200Z | LEET BLANK $1.90
10 BBQ BREAD, SLICED LOAF 12615020 LOAF 5 $2.04 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
11 TEXAS TOAST, SLICED LOAF 10040100 LOAF 7 $2.14 6499 20 OZ TEXAS TOAST LEFT BLANK $1.65
12 20 0Z LOAF BREAD, WHITEWHEAT 13410170 LOAF 8 $2.04 3087 \S/’VAS?ELZEOE (;'VZHOLE GRAIN || EFTBLANK $1.85
13 HONEY WHEAT BREAD 10215080 LOAF 8 $2.61 2823 gOAg,; LEE HONEY WHEAT | | Fer g1 ank $1.85
- RIWHOLE GRAIN
14 24 OZ. WHOLE GRAIN SANDWICH LOAF — 51% WHOLE GRAIN 13740595 LOAF 7 $2.24 3239 ey LEET BLANK $1.85
MINIMUM PRICE PRODUCT ITEM MINIMUM PRICE
GROUP TWO - ROLLS GROUP 11 ROLLS (DESCRIPTION) PRODUCT ITEM NUMBER| PACKAGING SRR ey NUMBER PACKAGING QUANTITY EAct)
1 BROWN AND SERVE (12 PACK) 61135000 12 CT 1 $2.45 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
WHOLE GRAIN WHITE
2 WHOLE WHEAT DINNER ROLLS (24 COUNT) 10024550 24CT 5 $3.20 6619 DINNER (12 COUNT) LEFT BLANK $1.80
3 LUNCHEON (CHIC ROLLS — FULLY BAKED, 24 PACK) 10029102 24CT 5 $2.75 5625 ;OCL‘T)N'AL SLIDERBUNS 1| ee7 BLANK $2.45
4 12 0Z. BUTTERBREAD DINNER ROLLS (12 COUNT) 10268820 12CT 7 $2.61 4145 SARALEE IHITEDINNER | T ANk $1.75
5 16 OZ. SWEET DINNER ROLL (HAWAII STYLE) 12-COUNT 10393440 12CT 6 $2.76 6493 SAR’SI'&ZEE:’;%’;”AN LEET BLANK $1.75
6 SUB ROLL WHITE 6” UNSLICED — (6 COUNT) 10320960 6CT 9 $2.68 7709 ARNOLD STRAKROLL® | erTBLank $1.65
- WHOLE GRAIN WHITE
7 SUB ROLL WHEAT 6” UNSLICED — (6 COUNT) 10306540 6CT 9 $2.73 4259 N e | LeeTBLANK $1.70
8 15 OZ. PHILLY STYLE HOAGIE ROLLS WITH SEEDS (6-COUNT) 10393650 6CT 9 $2.76 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
9 100% WHOLE WHEAT HOAGIE BUNS 10024500 12CT 4 $2.70 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
GROUP Il TOTAL -ROLLS $ 24.73 $ 11.10
MINIMUM PRICE PRODUCT ITEM MINIMUM PRICE
GROUP THREE - BUNS DESCRIPTION
PRODUCT ITEM NUMBER| PACKAGING SN =) NUMBER PACKAGING LI e
ARNOLD 100 WW HAM
1 15 0Z. HAMBURGER BUNS — 100% WHOLE WHEAT (8-COUNT) 10222670 8CT 9 $2.61 3587 BUNS 8CT LEFT BLANK $1.70
COLONIAL SEEDED HAM
2 HAMBURGER SEEDED 4" (12 PACK) 10026190 12CT 5 $2.21 3945 12-PK LEFT BLANK $2.15
3 51% WHOLE GRAIN HAMBURGER BUNS 4” (30 COUNT) 13730810 30CT 1 $5.68 5600 IHOLE SRAINWHITE | LEFT BLANK $4.50
4 100% WHOLE WHEAT HAMBURGER BUNS (30 COUNT) 10024580 30CT 1 $5.68 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
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5 15 OZ. ONION SANDWICH BUN 4” (8§ COUNT) 10308740 8CT 9 $2.76 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
4" WHITE HAMBURGER
6 SANDWICH 4” (12 PACK) 10026170 12CT 5 $2.01 3961 BUN 12 - PK LEFT BLANK $1.95
" WHOLE GRAIN WHITE
7 SUB ROLL WHEAT 6” UNSLICED — (6-COUNT) 10026710 30CT 1 $4.64 4259 T LEFT BLANK $1.70
8 HOT DOG, FOOT-LONG, SIDE-SLICE, 6” (8-COUNT) 10027620 6CT 8 $2.29 0951 E%%L#ONG BUNS6 LEFT BLANK $2.10
9 13 OZ. HOT DOG, BUNS - 100% WHOLE WHEAT SIDE-SLICED, 6”, 10229010 8CT 12 $2.61 3591 ARNOLD 100 WW HD BUNS LEET BLANK $1.70
(8-COUNT) 8CT == =-ATR
10 HOT DOG, SIDE SLICED, 6" (16 PACK) 10027480 16CT 6 $2.60 3962 COLONAL HOTDOG BUN| | EFT BLANK $2.25
1 HOT DOG SIDE SLICED, 6" (12 COUNT) 61127330 12¢T 6 $2.05 5541 o GOLPENFD- 1| EpT BLANK $1.95
12 51% WHOLE GRAIN HOT DOG BUNS 6” (16 COUNT) 13709190 16CT 6 $3.19 4266 WHOLE SRAINWHITEHD | | EFT BLANK $2.55
13 100% WHOLE WHEAT HOTDOG BUNS 67(16 COUNT) 10024590 16CT 6 $3.19 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
THOMAS Original EM 6
14 ENGLISH MUFFIN, WHITE & WHEAT (6 PK) BAAXXXXXX 6CT 5 $1.85 7002/7057 PK/ITHOMAS WW EM 6 PK LEFT BLANK $1.48
GROUP 11l TOTAL - BUNS $ 43.37 $ 24.03
MINIMUM PRICE PRODUCT ITEM MINIMUM PRICE
_ DESCRIPTION
GROUP FOUR — BAGELS PRODUCT ITEM NUMBER| PACKAGING QUANTITY e NUMBER PACKAGING SURTTTY || genen
1 BAGELS, PLAIN, SLICED, (6 COUNT) 64499790 5CT 5 $2.33 7078 ADMASPLAINBAGEL ) epT BLANK $2.40
2 28 0Z FLOUR TORTILLAS 7” (20-COUNT) 12967970 20CT 9 $2.99 NOBID NO BID LEFT BLANK $0.00
THOMAS EVERTHING
3 BAGELS, MIXED SEED, SLICED, (6 COUNT) 64499730 5CT 5 $2.33 7074 e LEFT BLANK $2.45
4 BAGELS, BLUEBERRY, SLICED (6 COUNT) 64471710 5CT 5 $233 7075 giggﬂ“GSCBTLUEBERRY LEFT BLANK $2.45
5 BAGELS, CINNAMON RAISIN, SLICED 64499740 5CT 5 $2.33 7079 ;:z:\lﬂ\lAGS é:-:_NNAMON LEFT BLANK $2.45
GROUP IV TOTAL $ 1231 $ .75
GRAND TOTAL LI, AND IV]$ 110.97 $ 67.28

1 2

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS FLOWERS BAKING CO OF BIRMINGHAM, LLC BIMBO BAKERIES USA
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES
Nutritional Analysis Labels - Each Line item NO YES
Debarment Statement YES YES
AMENDMENT 1 YES YES
Signature Page YES YES
Experience Statement YES YES
REQUIRED - PACA FORMS YES YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

FLOWERS BAKING CO OF BIRMINGHAM, LLC

900 16TH STREET NORTH BIRMINGHAM, AL 35203 /CURTIS LYONS, JR P: 205-263-9450 E: CURTIS LYONS@FLOCORP.COM

BIMBO BAKERIES USA

244 CLAYTON FOREST ROAD KERNERSVILLE, NC 27284 ROSALIE SZABO/ P: 336- 992-0036/ 804-295-9328 E: RSZABO@BBUMAIL.COM

EXCEPTIONS

BIMBO BAKERIES USA

1. $50.00 MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENT, 7 DAYS IN ADVANCE

2. RESERVE THE RIGHT TO DECLINE SOME PACA MEMBERS BASED ON SERVICE LOCATIONS; KIMBERLY TO BE THE

ONLY NON-SERVICEABLE LOCATION

3. OFFERS WEB ORDERING SERVICES

4. NOT A GRANT RECEIPENT
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